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The Sixth Extinction -
Elizabeth Kolbert 2014-01-01
"Over the last half billion years,
there have been five major
mass extinctions, when the
diversity of life on Earth
suddenly and dramatically
contracted. Scientists are
currently monitoring the sixth
extinction, predicted to be the
most devastating since the
asteroid impact that wiped out
the dinosaurs. This time
around the cataclysm is us. In
this book the author tells us
why and how human beings
have altered life on the planet
in a way no species has before.
She provides a moving account
of the disappearances of
various species occurring all
around us and traces the
evolution of extinction as
concept, from its first
articulation by Georges Cuvier
in revolutionary Paris up to
Lyell and Darwin, and through
the present day. The sixth
extinction is likely to be
mankind's most lasting legacy,
compelling us to rethink the
fundamental question of what
it means to be human". -- Back
cover.

On Solid Ground - David
Goldsmith 2023-01-10
On Solid Ground illustrates
what geologists know about the
earth by telling the stories of
the people who made major
geological discoveries. It also
chronicles the doubters and
nay-sayers who have worked so
hard to undermine our
understanding of the earth.
Each chapter of this book
contains three things: the
human story of a geologic
controversy, an explanation of
why geologists are so sure
about the right answer to that
controversy, and a short
discussion of the logical
fallacies being used by those
still unwilling to accept
geologic expertise.
Essay on the Theory of the
Earth - Georges baron Cuvier
1817

Anthropocene Reading - Tobias
Menely 2017-10-13
Few terms have garnered more
attention recently in the
sciences, humanities, and
public sphere than the
Anthropocene, the proposed
epoch in which a human
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“signature” appears in the
lithostratigraphic record.
Anthropocene Reading
considers the implications of
this concept for literary history
and critical method. Entering
into conversation with
geologists and geographers,
this volume reinterprets the
cultural past in relation to the
anthropogenic transformation
of the Earth system while
showcasing how literary
analysis may help us
conceptualize this geohistorical
event. The contributors
examine how a range of
literary texts, from The
Tempest to contemporary
dystopian novels to the poetry
of Emily Dickinson, mediate the
convergence of the social
institutions, energy regimes,
and planetary systems that
support the reproduction of
life. They explore the long-
standing dialogue between
imaginative literature and the
earth sciences and show how
scientists, novelists, and poets
represent intersections of
geological and human
timescales, the deep past and a
posthuman future, political

exigency and the carbon cycle.
Accessibly written and
representing a range of
methodological perspectives,
the essays in this volume
consider what it means to read
literary history in the
Anthropocene. Contributors
include Juliana Chow, Jeffrey
Jerome Cohen, Thomas H.
Ford, Anne-Lise François, Noah
Heringman, Matt Hooley,
Stephanie LeMenager, Dana
Luciano, Steve Mentz,
Benjamin Morgan, Justin
Neuman, Jennifer Wenzel, and
Derek Woods.
Late Cretaceous and Cenozoic
Mammals of North America -
Michael O. Woodburne 2004
This book places into modern
context the information by
which North American
mammalian paleontologists
recognize, divide, calibrate,
and discuss intervals of
mammalian evolution known as
North American Land Mammal
Ages. It incorporates new
information on the systematic
biology of the fossil record and
utilizes the many recent
advances in geochronologic
methods and their results. The
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book describes the increasingly
highly resolved stratigraphy
into which all available
temporally significant data and
applications are integrated.
Extensive temporal coverage
includes the Lancian part of
the Late Cretaceous, and
geographical coverage includes
information from Mexico, an
integral part of the North
American fauna, past and
present.
Tickle Your Catastrophe! -
Frederik Le Roy 2011
A collection of essays that
takes stock of the current
impact of the image and
imagination of the catastrophe
in art, science and philosophy
Historical Disasters in Context
- Andrea JANKU 2011-12-21
Growing concerns about
climate change and the
increasing occurrence of ever
more devastating natural
disasters in some parts of the
world and their consequences
for human life, not only in the
immediately affected regions,
but for all of us, have increased
our desire to learn more about
disaster experiences in the
past. How did disaster

experiences impact on the
development of modern
sciences in the early modern
era? Why did religion continue
to play such an important role
in the encounter with disasters,
despite the strong trend
towards secularization in the
modern world? What was the
political role of disasters?
Historical Disasters in Context
illustrates how past societies
coped with a threatening
environment, how societies
changed in response to disaster
experiences, and how disaster
experiences were processed
and communicated, both locally
and globally. Particular
emphasis is put on the realms
of science, religion, and
politics. International case
studies demonstrate that while
there are huge differences
across cultures in the way
people and societies responded
to disasters, there are also
many commonalities and
interactions between different
cultures that have the potential
to alter the ways people
prepare for and react to
disasters in future. To explain
these relationships and
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highlight their significance is
the purpose of this volume.
Making Way for Genius -
Kathleen Kete 2012-05-29
Examining the works of
Germaine de Stael, Stendhal
and Georges Cuvier, an
Associate Professor of
European History at Trinity
College creates a
groundbreaking cultural
history of ambition in post-
Revolutionary France.
Dinosaurs Ever Evolving - Allen
A. Debus 2016-06-21
From their discovery in the
19th century to the dawn of the
Nuclear Age, dinosaurs were
seen in popular culture as
ambassadors of the geological
past and as icons of the “life
through time” narrative of
evolution. They took on a more
foreboding character during
the Cold War, serving as a
warning to mankind with the
advent of the hydrogen bomb.
As fears of human extinction
escalated during the ecological
movement of the 1970s,
dinosaurs communicated their
metaphorical message of
extinction, urging us from our
destructive path. Using an

eclectic variety of examples,
this book outlines the three-
fold “evolution” of dinosaurs
and other prehistoric monsters
in pop culture, from their
poorly understood beginnings
to the 21st century.
The Rhinoceros and the
Megatherium - Juan Pimentel
2017-01-09
How did Europeans three
centuries apart respond to two
mysterious beasts—a living
rhinoceros previously known
only from ancient texts and a
nameless monster’s massive
bones? Juan Pimentel shows
that their reactions reflect
deep cultural changes but also
the enduring power of image
and imagination to shape our
understanding of the natural
world.
Fear and Fantasy in a Global
World - 2015-09-01
Fear and Fantasy in a Global
World is a collection of essays
which examines the processes,
meanings and relations
between fear and fantasy in the
globalized world, from bold
interdisciplinary and
comparative perspectives.
Catastrophic Thinking -
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David Sepkoski 2020
Introduction: Why Extinction
Matters -- The Meaning of
Extinction: Catastrophe,
Equilibrium, and Diversity --
Extinction in a Victorian Key --
Catastrophe and Modernity --
Extinction in the Shadow of the
Bomb -- The Asteroid and the
Dinosaur -- A Sixth Extinction?
The Making of a Biodiversity
Crisis -- Epilogue: Extinction in
the Anthropocene.
Routledge Revivals: John
Phillips and the Business of
Victorian Science (2005) -
Jack Morrell 2016-10-04
First published in 2005, this
book represents the first full
length biography of John
Phillips, one of the most
remarkable and important
scientists of the Victorian
period. Adopting a broad
chronological approach, this
book not only traces the
development of Phillips’ career
but clarifies and highlights his
role within Victorian culture,
shedding light on many wider
themes. It explores how
Phillips’ love of science was
inseparable from his need to
earn a living and develop a

career which could sustain
him. Hence questions of power,
authority, reputation and
patronage were central to
Phillips’ career and scientific
work. Drawing on a wealth of
primary sources and a rich
body of recent writings on
Victorian science, this
biography brings together his
personal story with the
scientific theories and
developments of the day, and
fixes them firmly within the
context of wider society.
The Well-Educated Mind: A
Guide to the Classical
Education You Never Had
(Updated and Expanded) -
Susan Wise Bauer 2015-11-16
The enduring and engaging
guide to educating yourself in
the classical tradition. Have
you lost the art of reading for
pleasure? Are there books you
know you should read but
haven’t because they seem too
daunting? In The Well-
Educated Mind, Susan Wise
Bauer provides a welcome and
encouraging antidote to the
distractions of our age,
electronic and otherwise.
Newly expanded and updated



7

to include standout works from
the twenty-first century as well
as essential readings in science
(from the earliest works of
Hippocrates to the discovery of
the asteroid that killed the
dinosaurs), The Well-Educated
Mind offers brief, entertaining
histories of six literary
genres—fiction, autobiography,
history, drama, poetry, and
science—accompanied by
detailed instructions on how to
read each type. The annotated
lists at the end of each
chapter—ranging from
Cervantes to Cormac
McCarthy, Herodotus to Laurel
Thatcher Ulrich, Aristotle to
Stephen Hawking—preview
recommended reading and
encourage readers to make
vital connections between
ancient traditions and
contemporary writing. The
Well-Educated Mind reassures
those readers who worry that
they read too slowly or with
below-average comprehension.
If you can understand a daily
newspaper, there’s no reason
you can’t read and enjoy
Shakespeare’s sonnets or Jane
Eyre. But no one should

attempt to read the “Great
Books” without a guide and a
plan. Bauer will show you how
to allocate time to reading on a
regular basis; how to master
difficult arguments; how to
make personal and literary
judgments about what you
read; how to appreciate the
resonant links among texts
within a genre—what does
Anna Karenina owe to Madame
Bovary?—and also between
genres. In her best-selling work
on home education, The Well-
Trained Mind, the author
provided a road map of
classical education for parents
wishing to home-school their
children; that book is now the
premier resource for home-
schoolers. In The Well-
Educated Mind, Bauer takes
the same elements and
techniques and adapts them to
the use of adult readers who
want both enjoyment and self-
improvement from the time
they spend reading. Followed
carefully, her advice will
restore and expand the
pleasure of the written word.
Small Things in the
Eighteenth Century - Chloe
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Wigston Smith 2022-09-29
Playful, useful, decorative,
revolutionary: small things
possess a rich array of
meanings, from the ordinary to
the extraordinary.
Assembling the Dinosaur -
Lukas Rieppel 2019-06-10
Lukas Rieppel shows how
dinosaurs gripped the popular
imagination and became
emblems of America’s
industrial power and economic
prosperity during the Gilded
Age. Spectacular fossils were
displayed in museums financed
by North America’s wealthiest
tycoons, to cement their
reputation as both benefactors
of science and fierce
capitalists.
Nature and Scripture in the
Abrahamic Religions: 1700-
Present - Scott Mandelbrote
2009-01-31
These volumes describe how
the development of the
different styles of
interpretation found in reading
scripture and nature have
transformed ideas of both the
written word and the created
world.
The Bible, Rocks and Time -

Davis A. Young 2008-08-18
Davis A. Young and Ralph
Stearley seek to convince
readers of the vast antiquity of
the Earth. They point out the
flaws of young-Earth
creationism and counter the
impression by many scientists
that all Christians are young-
Earth creationists.
The New Science of Geology -
Martin J.S. Rudwick
2023-04-14
The science of geology was
constructed in the decades
around 1800 from earlier
practices that had been
significantly different in their
cognitive goals. In the studies
collected here Martin Rudwick
traces how it came to be
recognised as a new kind of
natural science, because it was
constituted around the idea
that the natural world had its
own history. The earth had to
be understood not only in
relation to unchanging natural
laws that could be observed in
action in the present, but also
in terms of a pre-human past
that could be reliably known,
even if not directly observable
and its traces only
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fragmentarily preserved. In
contrast to this radically novel
sense of nature's own
contingent history, the earth's
unimaginably vast timescale
was already taken for granted
by many naturalists (though
not yet by the wider public),
and the concurrent
development of biblical
scholarship precluded any
significant sense of conflict
with religious tradition. A
companion volume, Lyell and
Darwin, Geologists: Studies in
the Earth Sciences in the Age
of Reform, was published in
2005.
Narratives of Educating for
Sustainability in Unsustainable
Environments - Jane Haladay
2017-12-01
Through pedagogical
narratives, literary analyses,
reflective essays, and
collaborative dialogues,
Narratives of Educating for
Sustainability in Unsustainable
Environments explores the
professional and intellectual
tensions of curricula,
pedagogies, and personal
practices that honor the
relationships of interspecies

ecologies, reinhabit and
reconceive wounded
landscapes and wounding
institutions, and allow us to
reattune ourselves to new yet
ancient frameworks for
sustainability. For the writers
here, fostering sustainability in
higher education means
focusing on place, creating
positive relationships with
humans and other beings, and
creating administrative
structures that will maintain
new approaches for the long-
term, showing how teaching
environmentally is at once
intensely site-specific yet
powerfully global, deeply
personal yet visibly public.
Narratives of Educating for
Sustainability in Unsustainable
Environments confronts the
contexts that make
environmental pedagogies
difficult, the challenges to the
well-being of the teacher-
scholar, and the corrosive
academic structures that
compartmentalize knowledge
and people. The collection
simultaneously offers models
for working through and within
these challenges to advance
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understandings and ways of
being on local, global, and
personal levels that will turn
the planetary tide toward
effective and shared
sustainability.
Paradoxes in Geology - U.
Briegel 2001-12-06
An interesting volume
presenting the papers collected
for the Festschrift "Paradoxes
in Modern Geology" in honor of
Professor Ken Jinghwa Hsu on
the occasion of his 70th
birthday. Paradox, as defined
in a dictionary, is a statement
contrary to accepted opinion.
That a broad discussion of
paradoxes is fruitful for the
advancement of science in
general, and geosciences in
particular, has been amply
demonstrated by Professor Hsu
throughout his distinguished
career. Not only has he
propelled the geoscience
community forward with his
controversial statements, a
number of his former students,
who are currently in key
positions at universities and in
industry, are influencing in a
similar open minded way the
present day thinking. The wide

scope this reasoning
encompasses is demonstrated
by the contributions to this
book, delineating paradoxes
and problems in the fields of
tectonics, basic and applied
geosciences, petrology,
paleoceanography,
paleoclimatology and
paleogeography, kinematics
and modelling.
The Routledge Handbook of
Philosophy of Biodiversity -
Justin Garson 2016-10-04
Biological diversity - or
‘biodiversity’ - is the degree of
variation of life within an
ecosystem. It is a relatively
new topic of study but has
grown enormously in recent
years. Because of its
interdisciplinary nature the
very concept of biodiversity is
the subject of debate amongst
philosophers, biologists,
geographers and
environmentalists. The
Routledge Handbook of
Philosophy of Biodiversity is an
outstanding reference source
to the key topics and debates in
this exciting subject.
Comprising twenty-three
chapters by a team of
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international contributors the
Handbook is divided into six
parts: Historical and
sociological contexts, focusing
on the emergence of the term
and early attempts to measure
biodiversity What is
biodiversity? How should
biodiversity be defined? How
can biodiversity include
entities at the edge of its
boundaries, including microbial
diversity and genetically
engineered organisms? Why
protect biodiversity? What can
traditional environmental
ethics contribute to
biodiversity? Topics covered
include anthropocentrism,
intrinsic value, and ethical
controversies surrounding the
economics of biodiversity
Measurement and
methodology: including
decision-theory and
conservation, the use of
indicators for biodiversity, and
the changing use of genetics in
biodiversity conservation
Social contexts and global
justice: including conservation
and community conflicts and
biodiversity and cultural values
Biodiversity and other

environmental values: How
does biodiversity relate to
other values like ecological
restoration or ecological
sustainability? Essential
reading for students and
researchers in philosophy,
environmental science and
environmental studies, and
conservation management, it
will also be extremely useful to
those studying biodiversity in
subjects such as biology and
geography.
A New History of Life - Peter
Ward 2015-04-07
The history of life on Earth is,
in some form or another,
known to us all--or so we think.
A New History of Life offers a
provocative new account,
based on the latest scientific
research, of how life on our
planet evolved--the first major
new synthesis for general
readers in two decades.
Charles Darwin's theories, first
published more than 150 years
ago, form the backbone of how
we understand the history of
the Earth. In reality, the
currently accepted history of
life on Earth is so flawed, so
out of date, that it's past time
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we need a 'New History of
Life.' In their latest book, Joe
Kirschvink and Peter Ward will
show that many of our most
cherished beliefs about the
evolution of life are wrong.
Gathering and analyzing years
of discoveries and research not
yet widely known to the public,
A New History of Life proposes
a different origin of species
than the one Darwin proposed,
one which includes eight-foot-
long centipedes, a frozen
“snowball Earth”, and the
seeds for life originating on
Mars. Drawing on their years
of experience in paleontology,
biology, chemistry, and
astrobiology, experts Ward and
Kirschvink paint a picture of
the origins life on Earth that
are at once too fabulous to
imagine and too familiar to
dismiss--and looking forward, A
New History of Life brilliantly
assembles insights from some
of the latest scientific research
to understand how life on
Earth can and might evolve far
into the future.
Origins - Frank H. T. Rhodes
2016-07-29
"Fossils are the fragments from

which, piece by laborious
piece, the great mosaic of the
history of life has been
constructed. Here and there,
we can supplement these
meager scraps by the use of
biochemical markers or
geochemical signatures that
add useful information, but,
even with such additional help,
our reconstructions and our
models of descent are often
tentative. For the fossil record
is, as we have seen, as biased
as it is incomplete. But
fragmentary, selective, and
biased though it is, the fossil
record, with all its
imperfections, is still a
treasure. Though whole
chapters are missing, many
pages lost, and the earliest
pages so damaged as to be, as
yet, virtually unreadable,
this—the greatest biography of
all—is one in whose closing
pages we find
ourselves."—from Origins In
Origins, Frank H. T. Rhodes
explores the origin and
evolution of living things, the
changing environments in
which they have developed,
and the challenges we now
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face on an increasingly
crowded and polluted planet.
Rhodes argues that the future
well-being of our burgeoning
population depends in no small
part on our understanding of
life’s past, its long and slow
development, and its intricate
interdependencies. Rhodes’s
accessible and extensively
illustrated treatment of the
origins narrative describes the
nature of the search for
prehistoric life, the significance
of geologic time, the origin of
life, the emergence and spread
of flora and fauna, the
evolution of primates, and the
emergence of modern humans.
The Great Naturalists - Robert
Huxley 2019-09-24
The story of natural history as
seen through the lives,
observations, and discoveries
of the world’s greatest
naturalists. “How the sciences
of geology, biology, ecology
and paleontology developed
over three centuries is
wonderfully illuminated in this
volume.” —Publishers Weekly
We owe a debt of gratitude to
the naturalists who described,
experimented, collected, and

gave us the means to
understand the natural world.
They came from all over the
globe, from classical times to
the end of the nineteenth
century, when natural history
changed from a mainly
amateur pursuit to today’s
specialized scientific
profession. Braving
dangers—including storms,
pirates, and disease—in pursuit
of cataloging the natural world,
pioneers such as Alexander von
Humboldt and Charles Darwin
changed the course of science
with their groundbreaking
theories. This book includes
many naturalists who are well
known, such as the earliest
great natural historian,
Aristotle; Carl Linnaeus, the
man who brought order to
nature; the ornithologist and
painter John James Audubon;
and Georges Cuvier, who
established the concept of
extinction. Others are now
given their rightful place:
Antony van Leeuwenhoek, who
made his own microscopes and
discovered bacteria; and Mary
Anning, “the princess of
paleontology,” who had an
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amazing, self-taught talent for
finding fossils. Many of these
people were great artists as
well as scientists, and The
Great Naturalists is illustrated
with a selection of beautiful
and precise paintings and
drawings of birds, animals,
fossils, fish, shells, and rocks
from the unparalleled
collections of the Natural
History Museum, London.
Georges Cuvier, Fossil Bones,
and Geological Catastrophes -
Martin J. S. Rudwick
2008-04-15
French zoologist Georges
Cuvier (1769-1832) helped
form and bring credibility to
geology and paleontology. Here
Martin J. S. Rudwick provides
the first modern translation of
Cuvier's essential writings on
fossils and catastrophes and
links these translated texts
together with his own
insightful narrative and
interpretive commentary.
"Martin Rudwick has done
English-speaking science a
considerable service by
translating and commenting on
Cuvier's work. . . . He guides us
through Cuvier's most

important writings, especially
those which demonstrate his
new technique of comparative
anatomy."—Douglas Palmer,
New Scientist
Nineteenth-Century Science -
A.S. Weber 2000-03-10
Nineteenth-Century Science is
a science anthology which
provides over 30 selections
from original 19th-century
scientific monographs,
textbooks and articles written
by such authors as Charles
Darwin, Mary Somerville, J.W.
Goethe, John Dalton, Charles
Lyell and Hermann von
Helmholtz. The volume surveys
scientific discovery and
thought from Jean-Baptiste
Lamarck’s theory of evolution
of 1809 to the isolation of
radium by Marie and Pierre
Curie in 1898. Each selection
opens with a biographical
introduction, situating each
scientist and discovery within
the context of history and
culture of the period. Each
entry is also followed by a list
of further suggested reading
on the topic. A broad range of
technical and popular material
has been included, from
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Mendeleev’s detailed
description of the periodic
table to Faraday’s highly
accessible lecture for young
people on the chemistry of a
burning candle. The anthology
will be of interest to the
general reader who would like
to explore in detail the
scientific, cultural, and
intellectual development of the
nineteenth-century, as well as
to students and teachers who
specialize in the science,
literature, history, or sociology
of the period. The book
provides examples from all the
disciplines of western science-
chemistry, physics, medicine,
astronomy, biology,
evolutionary theory, etc. The
majority of the entries consist
of complete, unabridged
journal articles or book
chapters from original 19th-
century scientific texts.
Global Scientific Practice in
an Age of Revolutions,
1750-1850 - Patrick Manning
2016-07-24
The century from 1750 to 1850
was a period of dramatic
transformations in world
history, fostering several types

of revolutionary change beyond
the political landscape.
Independence movements in
Europe, the Americas, and
other parts of the world were
catalysts for radical economic,
social, and cultural reform. And
it was during this age of
revolutions—an era of rapidly
expanding scientific
investigation—that profound
changes in scientific
knowledge and practice also
took place. In this volume, an
esteemed group of
international historians
examines key elements of
science in societies across
Spanish America, Europe, West
Africa, India, and Asia as they
overlapped each other
increasingly. Chapters focus on
the range of participants in
eighteenth- and nineteenth-
century science, their
concentrated effort in
description and taxonomy, and
advancements in techniques
for sharing knowledge.
Together, contributors
highlight the role of scientific
change and development in
tightening global and imperial
connections, encouraging a
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deeper conversation among
historians of science and world
historians and shedding new
light on a pivotal moment in
history for both fields.
Lyell and Darwin, Geologists
- Martin J.S. Rudwick
2023-07-07
The studies in this second
volume by Martin Rudwick (the
first being The New Science of
Geology: Studies in the Earth
Science in the Age of Reform)
focus on the figures of Charles
Lyell and Charles Darwin. Lyell
rose to be of pivotal
importance in the second
quarter of the 19th century
because he challenged other
geologists throughout Europe
by probing their methods and
conclusions to the limit. While
adopting their goal of
reconstructing the contingent
history of the earth, he claimed
that the physical processes
observable in action in the
present could explain far more
about the past than was
commonly believed, and that it
was unnecessary to postulate
occasional catastrophic events
of still greater intensity. Far
more controversial was Lyell's

further claim that the earth
and its life had always been in
a stable steady state, rather
than developing in a broadly
linear or directional fashion.
His younger friend Charles
Darwin first made his name as
a Lyellian geologist; Darwin's
early work in geology, studied
here, provided important
foundations for his later and
more famous research on
speciation and other biological
problems.
The Fate of the Mammoth -
Claudine Cohen 2002-04-02
Reveals new information about
the mammoth elephant, and
about the science that grew up
around its discovery.
Nature and Scripture in the
Abrahamic Religions: God,
Scripture and the rise of
modern science (1200-1700)
- Jitse M. van der Meer 2008
These volumes describe how
the development of the
different styles of
interpretation found in reading
scripture and nature have
transformed ideas of both the
written word and the created
world.
A Natural History of Time -
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Pascal Richet 2009-10-15
The quest to pinpoint the age
of the Earth is nearly as old as
humanity itself. For most of
history, people trusted
mythology or religion to
provide the answer, even
though nature abounds with
clues to the past of the Earth
and the stars. In A Natural
History of Time, geophysicist
Pascal Richet tells the
fascinating story of how
scientists and philosophers
examined those clues and from
them built a chronological
scale that has made it possible
to reconstruct the history of
nature itself. Richet begins his
story with mythological
traditions, which were heavily
influenced by the seasons and
almost uniformly viewed time
cyclically. The linear history
promulgated by Judaism, with
its story of creation, was an
exception, and it was that
tradition that drove early
Christian attempts to date the
Earth. For instance, in 169 CE,
the bishop of Antioch, for
instance declared that the
world had been in existence for
“5,698 years and the odd

months and days.” Until the
mid-eighteenth century, such
natural timescales derived
from biblical chronologies
prevailed, but, Richet
demonstrates, with the
Scientific Revolution geological
and astronomical evidence for
much longer timescales began
to accumulate. Fossils and the
developing science of geology
provided compelling evidence
for periods of millions and
millions of years—a scale that
even scientists had difficulty
grasping. By the end of the
twentieth century, new tools
such as radiometric dating had
demonstrated that the solar
system is four and a half billion
years old, and the universe
itself about twice that, though
controversial questions remain.
The quest for time is a story of
ingenuity and determination,
and like a geologist, Pascal
Richet carefully peels back the
strata of that history, giving us
a chance to marvel at each
layer and truly appreciate how
far our knowledge—and our
planet—have come.
The Universe Within - Neil
Shubin 2013-01-08
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In The Universe Within, Neil
Shubin, one of the world's
leading experts, reveals to us
the extraordinary cosmic and
evolutionary adventure of our
own bodies. During the past
13.7 billion years (or so) since
the Big Bang, our universe has
evolved, stars have formed and
died and our planet congealed
from the matter in space. For
aeons, the earth has circled the
sun while mountains, seas and
entire continents have come
and gone. Against this epic
backdrop, humanity's place in
the cosmos can look tiny and
insignificant. But as Neil
Shubin shows in this revelatory
new book, the one place where
universe, solar system and
planet merge is inside your
body. Shubin shows how the
origin of the Moon is tied to
our internal body clocks; how
the vast amounts of water on
Earth and inside all living
creatures crossed the deepest
stretches of space to us; how
strange fluctuations in the
orbits within our solar system
have led to our irregular ice-
ages; and how tiny imbalances
in the chaos immediately after

the Big Bang can explain why
matter exists at all. Delving
below the earth's surface and
into the frozen Arctic,
exploring the smallest atomic
structures and the vast reaches
of space, Neil Shubin uncovers
a sublimely beautiful, almost
magical truth: that in every one
of us lies the most profound
story of all - how we and our
world came to be. 'Shubin is
not only a distinguished
scientist, but a wonderfully
lucid and elegant writer; he is
an irrepressibly enthusiastic
teacher ... a science writer of
the first rank', Oliver Sacks
Neil Shubin is a palaeontologist
in the great tradition of his
mentors, Ernst Mayr and
Stephen Jay Gould. He has
discovered fossils around the
world that have changed the
way we think about many of
the key transitions in evolution
and has pioneered a new
synthesis of expeditionary
palaeontology, developmental
genetics and genomics. He
trained at Columbia, Harvard
and Berkeley and is currently a
Professor in the Department of
Organismal Biology and
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Anatomy at the University of
Chicago. His previous book is
Your Inner Fish: The amazing
discovery of our 375-million-
year-old ancestor.
John Phillips and the Business
of Victorian Science - Jack
Morrell 2017-11-28
John Phillips was one of the
most remarkable and important
scientists of the Victorian
period. Orphaned at the age of
seven and brought up by his
uncle, he rose to hold a number
of highly prestigious posts
within the British academic
and scientific community,
despite lacking a university
education. By the time of his
death in 1874 he was widely
regarded as one of the pioneers
and champions of the science
of geology, yet until now there
has been no full length
biography of Phillips. In
rectifying this lacuna, Jack
Morrell has produced a
meticulous and magisterial
piece of scholarship that does
justice to the achievements and
legacy of John Phillips.
Adopting a broadly
chronological approach, the
book not only traces the

development of Phillips's
career but clarifies and
highlights his role within
Victorian culture, shedding
light on many wider themes. It
explores how Phillips' love of
science was inseparable from
his need to earn a living and
develop a career which could
sustain him. Hence questions
of power, authority, reputation
and patronage were central to
Phillips's career and scientific
work. Drawing on a wealth of
primary sources and a rich
body of recent writings on
Victorian science, this
biography provides a
fascinating and compelling
account of John Phillips and his
legacy. Pulling together his
personal story with the
scientific theories and
developments of the day, and
fixing them firmly within the
context of wider society, this
biography will be vital reading
for anyone with an interest in
the history of British and
nineteenth-century science.
The Story of Western
Science: From the Writings
of Aristotle to the Big Bang
Theory - Susan Wise Bauer
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2015-05-11
A riveting road map to the
development of modern
scientific thought. In the
tradition of her perennial
bestseller The Well-Educated
Mind, Susan Wise Bauer
delivers an accessible,
entertaining, and illuminating
springboard into the scientific
education you never had. Far
too often, public discussion of
science is carried out by
journalists, voters, and
politicians who have received
their science secondhand. The
Story of Western Science
shows us the joy and
importance of reading
groundbreaking science
writing for ourselves and
guides us back to the
masterpieces that have
changed the way we think
about our world, our cosmos,
and ourselves. Able to be
referenced individually, or read
together as the narrative of
Western scientific
development, the book's
twenty-eight succinct chapters
lead readers from the first
science texts by Hippocrates,
Plato, and Aristotle through

twentieth-century classics in
biology, physics, and
cosmology. The Story of
Western Science illuminates
everything from mankind's
earliest inquiries to the
butterfly effect, from the birth
of the scientific method to the
rise of earth science and the
flowering of modern biology.
Each chapter recommends one
or more classic books and
provides entertaining accounts
of crucial contributions to
science, vivid sketches of the
scientist-writers, and clear
explanations of the mechanics
underlying each concept. The
Story of Western Science
reveals science to be a
dramatic undertaking practiced
by some of history's most
memorable characters. It
reminds us that scientific
inquiry is a human pursuit—an
essential, often deeply
personal, sometimes flawed,
frequently brilliant way of
understanding the world. The
Story of Western Science is an
"entertaining and unique
synthesis" (Times Higher
Education), a "fluidly written"
narrative that "celebrates the
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inexorable force of human
curiosity" (Wall Street Journal),
and a "bright, informative
resource for readers seeking to
understand science through
the eyes of the men and women
who shaped its history"
(Kirkus). Previously published
as The Story of Science.
Eternal Ephemera - Niles
Eldredge 2015-03-03
All organisms and species are
transitory, yet life endures. The
origin, extinction, and
evolution of
species—interconnected in the
web of life as "eternal
ephemera"—are the concern of
evolutionary biology. In this
riveting work, renowned
paleontologist Niles Eldredge
follows leading thinkers as they
have wrestled for more than
two hundred years with the
eternal skein of life composed
of ephemeral beings,
revitalizing evolutionary
science with their own, more
resilient findings. Eldredge
begins in France with the
naturalist Jean-Baptiste
Lamarck, who in 1801 first
framed the overarching
question about the emergence

of new species. The Italian
geologist Giambattista Brocchi
followed, bringing in geology
and paleontology to expand the
question. In 1825, at the
University of Edinburgh,
Robert Grant and Robert
Jameson introduced the
astounding ideas formulated by
Lamarck and Brocchi to a
young medical student named
Charles Darwin. Who can
doubt that Darwin left for his
voyage on the Beagle in 1831
filled with thoughts about these
daring new explanations for
the "transmutation" of species.
Eldredge revisits Darwin's
early insights into evolution in
South America and his later
synthesis of knowledge into a
theory of the origin of species.
He then considers the ideas of
more recent evolutionary
thinkers, such as George
Gaylord Simpson, Ernst Mayr,
and Theodosius Dobzhansky, as
well as the young and brash
Niles Eldredge and Steven Jay
Gould, who set science afire
with their concept of
punctuated equilibria. Filled
with insights into evolutionary
biology and told with a rich
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affection for the scientific
arena, this book celebrates the
organic, vital relationship
between scientific thinking and
its subjects.
Describing the Hand of God -
Robert Brennan 2016-04-28
The question of divine agency
in the world remains one
important unresolved
underlying obstacle in the
dialogue between theology and
science. Modern notions of
divine agency are shown to
have developed out of the
interaction of three factors in
early modernity. Two are well
known: late medieval perfect-
being theology and the early
modern application of the
notion of the two books of
God's revelation to the
understanding of the natural
order. It is argued the third is
the early modern appropriation
of theAugustinian doctrine of
inspiration. This assumes the
soul's existence and a
particular description of divine
agency in humans, which
became more generally applied
to divine agency in nature.
Whereas Newton explicitly
draws the parallel between

divine agency in humans and
that in nature, Darwin rejects
its supposed perfection and
Huxley raises serious questions
regarding the traditional
understanding of the soul. This
book offers an alternative
incarnational description of
divine agency, freeing
consideration of divine agency
from being dependent on
resolving the complex issues of
perfect-being theology and the
existence of the soul. In
conversation with Barth's
pneumatology, this proposal is
shown to remain theologically
coherent and plausible while
resolving or avoiding a range
of known difficulties in the
science-theology dialogue.
Victorian Time - T. Ferguson
2013-01-17
Victorian Time examines how
literature of the era registers
the psychological impact of the
onset of a modern,
industrialized experience of
time as time-saving
technologies, such as steam-
powered machinery, aimed at
making economic life more
efficient, signalling the dawn of
a new age of accelerated time.
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Architectural Theory of
Modernism - Ute Poerschke
2016-04-20
Architectural Theory of
Modernism presents an
overview of the discourse on
function-form concepts from
the beginnings, in the
eighteenth century, to its peak
in High Modernism.
Functionalist thinking and its
postmodern criticism during
the second half of the twentieth
century is explored, as well as
today's functionalism in the
context of systems theory,
sustainability, digital design,
and the information society.
The book covers, among
others, the theories of Carlo
Lodoli, Gottfried Semper,
Eugène-Emmanuel Viollet-le-
Duc, Louis Sullivan, Frank
Lloyd Wright, Hannes Meyer,
Adolf Behne, CIAM, Jane
Jacobs, Robert Venturi and
Denise Scott Brown, Charles
Jencks, William Mitchell, and
Manuel Castells.
Geographies of Nineteenth-
Century Science - David N.
Livingstone 2011-12-01
In Geographies of Nineteenth-
Century Science, David N.

Livingstone and Charles W. J.
Withers gather essays that
deftly navigate the spaces of
science in this significant
period and reveal how each is
embedded in wider systems of
meaning, authority, and
identity. Chapters from a
distinguished range of
contributors explore the places
of creation, the paths of
knowledge transmission and
reception, and the import of
exchange networks at various
scales. Studies range from the
inspection of the places of
London science, which show
how different scientific sites
operated different moral and
epistemic economies, to the
scrutiny of the ways in which
the museum space of the
Smithsonian Institution and the
expansive space of the
American West produced
science and framed
geographical understanding.
This volume makes clear that
the science of this era varied in
its constitution and reputation
in relation to place and
personnel, in its nature by
virtue of its different epistemic
practices, in its audiences, and
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in the ways in which it was put to work.


