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Right here, we have countless book Paul Ricoeur Hermeneutics
And Human Science and collections to check out. We
additionally present variant types and also type of the books to
browse. The conventional book, fiction, history, novel, scientific
research, as competently as various new sorts of books are readily
approachable here.

As this Paul Ricoeur Hermeneutics And Human Science, it ends in
the works bodily one of the favored book Paul Ricoeur
Hermeneutics And Human Science collections that we have. This is
why you remain in the best website to see the incredible books to
have.

Paul Ricoeur’s Idea of
Reference - Sanja Ivic
2018-11-26
This study brings together
various disciplines:
hermeneutics, literary theory,
philosophy of science,
aesthetics, etc. to reflect on the
issue of reference and narrative
knowing from the perspective
of Ricoeur’s hermeneutics.
Hermeneutics and the Human
Sciences - Paul Ricoeur
2016-08-26

Collected and translated by
John B. Thompson, this
collection of essays by Paul
Ricoeur includes many that had
never appeared in English
before the volume's publication
in 1981. As comprehensive as it
is illuminating, this lucid
introduction to Ricoeur's prolific
contributions to sociological
theory features his more recent
writings on the history of
hermeneutics, its central
themes and issues, his own
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constructive position and its
implications for sociology,
psychoanalysis and history.
Presented in a fresh twenty-
first-century series livery, and
including a specially
commissioned preface written
by Charles Taylor, illuminating
its enduring importance and
relevance to philosophical
enquiry, this classic work has
been revived for a new
generation of readers.
Critical Hermeneutics - John
B. Thompson 1983
A comparative critique of
ordinary language philosophy,
hermeneutics and critical
theory.
Gadamer and Ricoeur -
Francis J. Mootz III 2011-04-14
Hans-Georg Gadamer and Paul
Ricoeur were two of the most
important hermeneutical
philosophers of the twentieth
century. Gadamer single-
handedly revived hermeneutics
as a philosophical field with his
many essays and his
masterpiece, Truth and Method.
Ricoeur famously mediated the
Gadamer-Habermas debate and
advanced his own
hermeneutical philosophy

through a number of books
addressing social theory,
religion, psychoanalysis and
political philosophy. This book
brings Gadamer and Ricoeur
into a hermeneutical
conversation with each other
through some of their most
important commentators.
Twelve leading scholars deliver
contemporary assessments of
the history and promise of
hermeneutical philosophy,
providing focused discussion on
the work of these two key
hermeneutical thinkers. The
book shows how the horizons of
their thought at once support
and question each other and
how, in many ways, the work of
these two pioneering
philosophers defines the issues
and agendas for the new
century.
Explanation and Understanding
in the Human Sciences -
Gurpreet Mahajan 2011-08-02
Social scientists explain events
by identifying reasons and
causes. Occasionally they
weave a series of events into a
historical narrative. What is
entailed in each kind of
explanation? What form of
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explanation is adequate for the
social sciences? In this lucid
book, Gurpreet Mahajan
surveys each of the major
forms of inquiry—hermeneutic
understanding, narrative,
reason-action, and causal
explanation—to examine how
each method changes our
perceptions of social reality.
The third edition includes a new
Preface that discusses some
recent shifts in the
conceptualization of the social
sciences.
Habermas and Ricoeur’s
Depth Hermeneutics - Vinicio
Busacchi 2016-07-15
This book presents a critical
and systematic study of the
possibility to consider and
practice Freud’s psychoanalysis
as a form of depth
hermeneutics. It contributes to
a screening of the possibility of
a hermeneutical interpretation
of psychoanalysis, particularly
with respect to the therapeutic
practice. The book is an
investigation into the
philosophical implications of the
hermeneutical re-reading of
psychoanalysis and clarifies the
real speculative and theoretical

potential behind the dialectic of
hermeneutics and
psychoanalysis. It examines
two themes which, so far, have
remained unclarified and
unexplored in their potentiality:
firstly, at the level of a
construction of a procedural
model for the human and social
sciences, as well as for
philosophy, and, secondly, at
the level of a philosophy of the
human being able to subsume
and express the biological and
natural dimension of human
identity as well as its historical
narrative and social identity.
Paul Ricoeur - Steven H. Clark
2013-09-05
This introductory study surveys
the entire range of Ricoeur's
work, placing it within the
context of post-structuralism.
Includes a discussion of Time
and Narrative and shows how
Ricoeur's work links European
and American traditions.
Phenomenology and the Human
Sciences - J.N. Mohanty
2012-12-06

A Hermeneutics of
Contemplative Silence -
Michele Kueter Petersen
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2021-10-06
A Hermeneutics of
Contemplative Silence: Paul
Ricoeur, Edith Stein, and the
Heart of Meaning brings
together the work of Paul
Ricoeur and Edith Stein and
locates the role of silence in the
creation of meaning. Michele
Kueter Petersen argues that
human being is language and
silence. Contemplative silence
manifests a mode of capable
human being whereby a shared
world of meaning is constituted
and created. The analysis
culminates with the claim that a
hermeneutics of contemplative
silence manifests a deeper level
of awareness as a poetics of
presencing a shared humanity.
The term “awareness” refers to
five crucial levels of meaning-
creating consciousness that are
ingredients in the practice of
contemplative silence.
Contemplative awareness
includes self-critique as integral
to the experience and the
understanding of the virtuous
ordering of relational realities.
The practice of contemplative
silence is a spiritual and ethical
activity that aims at

transforming reflexive
consciousness. Inasmuch as it
leads to openness to new
motivation and intention for
acting in relation to others,
contemplative awareness elicits
movement through the ongoing
exercise of rethinking those
relational realities in and for the
world. The texts of Ricoeur and
Stein reveal a contemplative
discourse of praise and beauty
for capable human beings
whose actions and suffering
respond to word and silence.
Hermeneutics and the
Human Sciences - Paul
Ricoeur 2016-08-26
John B. Thompson's collection
of translated essays forms an
illuminating introduction to Paul
Ricoeur's prolific contributions
to sociological theory.
Methodology for the Human
Sciences - Donald E.
Polkinghorne 1984-06-30
Methodology for the Human
Sciences addresses the growing
need for a comprehensive
textbook that surveys the
emerging body of literature on
human science research and
clearly describes procedures
and methods for carrying out
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new research strategies. It
provides an overview of
developing methods, describes
their commonalities and
variations, and contains
practical information on how to
implement strategies in the
field. In it, Donald Polkinghorne
calls for a renewal of debate
over which methods are
appropriate for the study of
human beings, proposing that
the results of the extensive
changes in the philosophy of
science since 1960 call for a
reexamination of the original
issues of this debate. The book
traces the history of the
deliberations from Mill and
Dilthey to Hempel and logical
positivism, examines recently
developed systems of inquiry
and their importance for the
human sciences, and relates
these systems to the practical
problems of doing research on
topics related to human
experience. It discusses
historical realism, systems and
structures, phenomenology and
hermeneutics, action theory,
and the implications recent
systems have for a revised
human science methodology.

Hermeneutics - Paul Ricoeur
2013-02-04
Paul Ricoeur’s contribution to
the theory of interpretation, or
hermeneutics, is considerable:
he ranks among the masters of
this discipline alongside
Schleiermacher, Dilthey,
Heidegger and Gadamer. In
addition to major works like The
Conflict of Interpretations, he
wrote many articles and shorter
texts which deserve to be
discovered and rediscovered.
These allow us to gain a deeper
understanding of the
development of his work over
time and to appreciate the full
range of his contribution. Some
of the texts examine the nature
of metaphor while others guide
the reader through the many
challenges of the hermeneutic
problem - from the symbol to
the text, then to the text as
action, taking full account of
the ethical implications. Here
one encounters Ricoeur’s
reflections on the future of
hermeneutics and his abiding
concern to explore the relations
between hermeneutics and
analytical philosophy. Ricoeur’s
contribution to biblical
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hermeneutics has also been
decisive. Two masterful studies
in this volume attest to
Ricoeur’s attempt to explore
the relations between
revelation and truth, on the one
hand, and between myths of
salvation and reason, on the
other. This book - the second
volume of Ricoeur’s writings
and lectures - brings together
texts which appeared between
1972 and 2006. It is published
under the auspices of Le Fonds
Ricoeur.
Expanding Hermeneutics -
Don Ihde 1998
Expanding Hermeneutics
examines the development of
interpretation theory,
emphasizing how science in
practice involves and implicates
interpretive processes. Ihde
argues that the sciences have
developed a sophisticated
visual hermeneutics that
produces evidence by means of
imaging, visual displays, and
visualizations. From this
vantage point, Ihde
demonstrates how
interpretation is built into
technologies and instruments.
Paul Ricoeur’s Philosophical

Anthropology as Hermeneutics
of Liberation - Roger W.H.
Savage 2020-11-09
This book offers a unique
account of the role imagination
plays in advancing the course
of freedom’s actualization. It
draws on Paul Ricoeur’s
philosophical anthropology of
the capable human being as
the staging ground for an
extended inquiry into the
challenges of making freedom a
reality within the history of
humankind. This book locates
the abilities we exercise as
capable human beings at the
heart of a sustained analysis
and reflection on the place of
the idea of justice in a
hermeneutics for which every
expectation regarding rights,
liberties, and opportunities
must be a hope for humanity as
a whole. The vision of a
reconciled humanity that for
Ricoeur figures in a philosophy
of the will provides an initial
touchstone for a hermeneutics
of liberation rooted in a
philosophical anthropology for
which the pathétique of human
misery is its non- or pre-
philosophical source. By setting



7

the idea of the humanity in
each of us against the backdrop
of the necessity of preserving
the tension between the space
of our experiences and the
horizons of our expectations,
the book identifies the ethical
and political dimensions of the
idea of justice’s federating
force with the imperative of
respect. Paul Ricoeur’s
Philosophical Anthropology as
Hermeneutics of Liberation will
be of interest to scholars and
advanced students working in
hermeneutics, phenomenology,
ethics, political theory, and
aesthetics.
Hermeneutics and the
Human Sciences - Paul
Ricoeur 1989-01-01

A Ricoeur Reader - Paul
Ricoeur 1991-08-01
Paul Ricoeur is one of the most
important modern literary
theorists and a philosopher of
world renown. This collection
brings together his published
articles, papers, reviews, and
interviews that focus on literary
theory and criticism. The first of
four sections includes early
pieces that explore the

philosophical foundations for a
post-structural hermeneutics.
The second contains reviews
and essays in which Ricoeur
engages in debate over some
of the central themes of literary
theory, including
figuration/configuration and
narrativity. In the third section
are later essays on post-
structuralist hermeneutics, and
in the fourth, interviews in
which he discusses text,
language, and myths. Mario
Valdés provides an introduction
to the literary theories of Paul
Ricoeur and the works in this
collection particularly. He also
includes a complete
bibliography of Ricoeur's works
that have appeared in English.
History and Truth - Paul Ricœur
1965
Incredible originality of thought
in areas as vast as
phenomenology, religion,
hermeneutics, psychoanalysis,
intersubjectivity, language,
Marxism, and structuralism has
made Paul Ricoeur one of the
philosophical giants of the
twentieth century. The way in
which Ricoeur approaches
these themes makes his works
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relevant to the reader today: he
writes with honesty and depth
of insight into the core of a
problem, and his ability to mark
for future thought the very path
of philosophical inquiry is
nearly unmatched. In History
and Truth, Ricoeur investigates
the antinomy between history
and truth, or between
historicity and meaning. He
argues that history has
meaning insofar as it
approaches universality and
system but no meaning insofar
as this universality violates the
singularity of individuals' lives.
Imposing unity upon truth, or
unifying the diversity of
knowledge and opinion, creates
a singular and universal history
but destroys historicity and
subjectivity. Allowing for
singularities in history promotes
a multiplicity of truths over a
single, unique truth and
thereby annihilates system.
This volume and the other new
editions of Ricoeur's texts
published by Northwestern
University Press have joined the
canon of contemporary
continental philosophy and
continue to contribute to

emergent discussions in the
twenty-first century. Book
jacket.
Hermeneutics and the Human
Sciences - Paul Ricoeur
1981-08-31
A collection in translation of
essays by Paul Ricoeur.
The Philosophy of Paul Ricoeur -
Lewis Edwin Hahn 1995
Paul Ricoeur, widely regarded
as the foremost living
phenomenologist, has helped to
make the term hermeneutics a
household word. His writings
cover a wide range of topics,
from the history of philosophy,
literary criticism, and
aesthetics, to metaphysics,
ethics, religion, semiotics,
linguistic structuralism, and
psychoanalysis. Ricoeur's most
important works, including
Freedom and Nature, Freud and
Philosophy, The Conflict of
Interpretations, Time and
Narrative, The Symbolism of
Evil, and Oneself as Another,
have attracted enthusiastic
readers from many disciplines
and from every major cultural
milieu across the surface of the
globe.
Interdisciplinary
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Interpretation - Kenneth A.
Reynhout 2013-06-20
The past fifty years has seen
the emergence of an energetic
dialogue between religion and
the natural sciences that has
contributed to a growing desire
for interdisciplinarity among
many constructive theologians.
However, some have also
resisted this trend, in part
because it seems that the price
one must pay for such
engagement is much too high.
Interdisciplinary work appears
overly abstract and
methodologically restrictive,
with little room for systematic
theologians self-consciously
operating within a particular
historical tradition. In
Interdisciplinary Interpretation:
Paul Ricoeur and the
Hermeneutics of Theology and
Science,Kenneth A. Reynhout
seeks to address this concern
by constructing an alternative
understanding of
interdisciplinary theology based
on the hermeneutical thought
of Paul Ricoeur, generally
recognized as one of the most
interdisciplinary philosophers of
the twentieth century.

Appealing to Ricoeur’s view of
interpretation as the dialectical
process of understanding
through explanation, Reynhout
argues that theology’s
engagement with the natural
sciences is fundamentally
hermeneutical in character. As
such, interdisciplinary
theologians can faithfully
borrow meaning from the
sciences through a process of
“interdisciplinary
interpretation,” a process that
can honestly attend to the
legitimate challenges posed by
the natural sciences without
automatically requiring the
evacuation of theological norms
and convictions. Reynhout’s
creative appropriation of
Ricoeur’s hermeneutics
succeeds in providing a novel
interdisciplinary vision, not only
for theology but also for
interdisciplinary work in
general.
Hermeneutics and
Phenomenology in Paul
Ricoeur - Scott Davidson
2016-07-06
Hermeneutics and
Phenomenology in Paul Ricoeur:
Between Text and Phenomenon
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calls attention to the dynamic
interaction that takes place
between hermeneutics and
phenomenology in Ricoeur’s
thought. It could be said that
Ricoeur’s thought is placed
under a twofold demand:
between the rigor of the text
and the requirements of the
phenomenon. The rigor of the
text calls for fidelity to what the
text actually says, while the
requirement of the
phenomenon is established by
the Husserlian call to return “to
the things themselves.” These
two demands are interwoven
insofar as there is a
hermeneutic component of the
phenomenological attempt to
go beyond the surface of things
to their deeper meaning, just as
there is a phenomenological
component of the hermeneutic
attempt to establish a critical
distance toward the world to
which we belong. For this
reason, Ricoeur’s thought
involves a back and forth
movement between the text
and the phenomenon. Although
this double movement was a
theme of many of Ricoeur’s
essays in the middle of his

career, the essays in this book
suggest that hermeneutic
phenomenology remains
implicit throughout his work.
The chapters aim to highlight,
in much greater detail, how this
back and forth movement
between phenomenology and
hermeneutics takes place with
respect to many important
philosophical themes, including
the experience of the body,
history, language, memory,
personal identity, and
intersubjectivity.
Narrative Knowing and the
Human Sciences - Donald E.
Polkinghorne 2010-03-31
This book expands the concept
of the nature of science and
provides a practical research
alternative for those who work
with people and organizations.
Using literary criticism,
philosophy, and history, as well
as recent developments in the
cognitive and social sciences,
Narrative Knowing and the
Human Sciences shows how to
use research information
organized by the narrative
form—such information as
clinical life histories,
organizational case studies,
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biographic material, corporate
cultural designs, and literary
products. The relationship
between the narrative format
and classical and statistical and
experimental designs is
clarified and made explicit.
Suggestions for doing research
are given as well as criteria for
judging the accuracy and
quality of narrative research
results.
A Companion to Continental
Philosophy - Simon Critchley
1998-06-08
Covering the complete
development of post-Kantian
Continental philosophy, this
volume serves as an essential
reference work for philosophers
and those engaged in the many
disciplines that are integrally
related to Continental and
European Philosophy.
On Paul Ricoeur - Richard
Kearney 2017-07-05
Paul Ricoeur is one of the giants
of contemporary continental
philosophy and one of the most
enduring and wide-ranging
thinkers in the twentieth
century, publishing major works
ranging from existentialism and
phenomenology to

psychoanalysis, politics, religion
and the theory of language.
Richard Kearney offers a critical
engagement with the work of
Ricoeur, beginning with a
general introduction to his
hermeneutic philosophy. Part
one explores some of the main
themes in Ricouer's thought
under six headings:
phenomenology and
hermeneutics; language and
imagination; myth and
tradition; ideology and utopia;
evil and alterity; poetics and
ethics. The second part
comprises five dialogical
exchanges which Kearney has
conducted with Ricoeur over
the last three decades
(1977-2003), charting and
explaining his intellectual
itinerary. This book is aimed at
a broad student readership as
well as the general intelligent
reader interested in knowing
more about one of the most
enduring major figures in
contemporary continental
philosophy.
From Text to Action - Paul
Ricœur 1991-09
With his writings on
phenomenology,
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psychoanalysis, Marxism,
ideology, and religion, Paul
Ricoeur has single-handedly
redefined and revitalized the
hermeneutic tradition. From
Text to Action is an essential
companion to the now classic
The Conflict of Interpretations.
Here, Ricoeur continues and
extends his project of
constructing a general theory of
interpretation, positioning his
work in relation to its own
philosophical background:
Hegel, Husserl, Gadamer, and
Weber. He also responds to
contemporary figures like K.O.
Apel and Jürgen Habermas,
connecting his own theorization
of ideology to their version of
ideology critique.
Hermeneutics After Ricoeur -
John Arthos 2018-12-27
There has been a renaissance
of interest in the work and
thought of Paul Ricoeur, one of
the great hermeneutic scholars
of the twentieth century. It is
time to assess the future
landscape for hermeneutics as
a scholarly field and an
educational curriculum after
the momentous impact of Paul
Ricoeur, who extended and

deepened its trans-disciplinary
reach, and pushed its profile
substantially beyond its
German legacy. There exists a
misunderstanding that his
thought is simply an extension
or revision of Heidegger and
Gadamer; Hermeneutics After
Ricoeur ably sets out the
differences and tensions,
establishing the originality of
Ricoeur's thought and its
application beyond
hermeneutic studies, with a
thematic focus on education,
the humanities, and the liberal
arts.
Methodology for the Human
Sciences - Donald E.
Polkinghorne 1984-06-30
Methodology for the Human
Sciences addresses the growing
need for a comprehensive
textbook that surveys the
emerging body of literature on
human science research and
clearly describes procedures
and methods for carrying out
new research strategies. It
provides an overview of
developing methods, describes
their commonalities and
variations, and contains
practical information on how to
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implement strategies in the
field. In it, Donald Polkinghorne
calls for a renewal of debate
over which methods are
appropriate for the study of
human beings, proposing that
the results of the extensive
changes in the philosophy of
science since 1960 call for a
reexamination of the original
issues of this debate. The book
traces the history of the
deliberations from Mill and
Dilthey to Hempel and logical
positivism, examines recently
developed systems of inquiry
and their importance for the
human sciences, and relates
these systems to the practical
problems of doing research on
topics related to human
experience. It discusses
historical realism, systems and
structures, phenomenology and
hermeneutics, action theory,
and the implications recent
systems have for a revised
human science methodology.
The EPZ Conflict of
Interpretations - Paul Ricoeur
2005-01-01
Paul Ricoeur (1913-) is
Professor Emeritus of
Philosophy at the University of

Chicago and Dean of the
Faculty of Letters and Human
Sciences at the University of
Paris X, Nanterre. One of the
foremost contemporary French
philosophers, his work is
influenced by Husserl, Marcel
and Jaspers and is particularly
concerned with symbolism, the
creation of meaning and the
interpretation of texts. The
Conflict of Interpretations
ranges across an astonishing
diversity of fields: structuralism,
linguistics, psychoanalysis,
religion and faith. The essays it
comprises are bound together
by Ricoeur's customary concern
for interpretation and language
and all bear the stamp of the
systematic and critical thinking
which has become his hallmark
in contemporary philosophy.
Edited by Don Ihde>
Reframing the Masters of
Suspicion - Andrew Dole
2018-12-13
This book revisits Paul Ricoeur's
classification of Karl Marx,
Friedrich Nietzsche, and
Sigmund Freud as the “masters
of suspicion”, and provides a
thought-provoking critique for
critical religious studies



14

scholars, as well as anyone
working in critical theory more
broadly. Whereas Ricoeur saw
suspicion as a mode of
interpretation, Andrew Dole
argues that the method
common to his “masters” is
better understood as a mode of
explanation. Dole replaces
Ricoeur's hermeneutics of
suspicion with suspicious
explanation, which claims the
existence of hidden phenomena
that are bad in some
recognizable way. Each of the
masters, Dole argues, offered a
distinct kind of suspicious
explanation. Reconstructing
Marx, Nietzsche, and Freud in
this way brings their work into
conversation with conspiracy
theories, which are themselves
a type of suspicious
explanation. Dole argues that
conspiracy theories and other
types of suspicious explanation
are “cognitively ensnaring”, to
borrow a term from Pascal
Boyer. If they are true they are
importantly true, but their truth
or falsity can be very difficult to
ascertain.
Biblical Narrative in the
Philosophy of Paul Ricoeur -

Kevin J. Vanhoozer 1990-04-27
A critical account of Ricoeur's
theory of narrative
interpretation and its
contribution to theology.
Hermeneutics and the Human
Sciences - Paul Ricœur 1990

Paul Ricoeur's Hermeneutics
of the Imagination - Jeanne
Evans 1995
Paul Ricoeur's Hermeneutics of
the Imagination argues
Ricoeur's development of the
philosophy of the creative
imagination is vital to Ricoeur's
articulation of a critical
hermeneutics. Herein lies
Ricoeur's hermeneutical
contribution to the philosophy
of religion and the problem of
interpreting primary religious
texts that utilize plurivocal
forms of language. Evans
clarifies that it is through
Ricoeur's studies of metaphor
and narrative that he assesses
and explicates the subversive
power of the creative
imagination in terms of the
philosophy of language. Dr.
Evans systematizes this theme
of the philosophy of the
imagination from Fallible Man,
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the early work of Ricoeur to the
more recent publication of Time
and Narrative.
Homo Interpretans - Johann
Michel 2019
Leading contemporary
philosopher Johann Michel
offers an innovative reflection
on the human being. The book
presents an interdisciplinary
study that engages philosophy,
sociology and anthropology,
offering a systematic analysis
of the phenomenon of
interpretation.
The Conflict of
Interpretations - Paul Ricœur
1974
This collection brings together
twenty-two later essays by Paul
Ricoeur under the topics of
structuralism, psychoanalysis,
hermeneutics, and religion. In
dramatic conciseness, these
essays illuminate the work of
one of the leading philosophers
of the day. Those interested in
Ricoeur's development of the
philosophy of language will find
rich and suggestive reading.
Freedom and Nature - Paul
Ricoeur 1966
This volume, the first part of
Paul Ricoeur's Philosophy of the

Will, is an eidetics, carried out
within carefully imposed
phenomenological brackets. It
seeks to deal with the essential
structure of man's being in the
world, and so it suspends the
distorting dimensions of
existence, the bondage of
passion, and the vision of
innocence, to which Ricoeur
returns in his later writings. The
result is a conception of man as
an incarnate Cogito, which can
make the polar unity of subject
and object intelligible and
provide a basic continuity for
the various aspects of inquiry
into man's being-in-the-world.
The Course of Recognition -
Paul Ricoeur 2007-09-30
Recognition, though it figures
profoundly in our understanding
of objects and persons, identity
and ideas, has never before
been the subject of a single,
sustained philosophical inquiry.
This work, by one of
contemporary philosophy’s
most distinguished voices,
pursues recognition through its
various philosophical guises
and meanings—and, through
the “course of recognition,”
seeks to develop nothing less
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than a proper hermeneutics of
mutual recognition. Originally
delivered as lectures at the
Institute for the Human
Sciences at Vienna, the essays
collected here consider
recognition in three of its forms.
The first chapter, focusing on
knowledge of objects, points to
the role of recognition in
modern epistemology; the
second, concerned with what
might be called the recognition
of responsibility, traces the
understanding of agency and
moral responsibility from the
ancients up to the present day;
and the third takes up the
problem of recognition and
identity, which extends from
Hegel’s discussion of the
struggle for recognition through
contemporary arguments about
identity and multiculturalism.
Throughout, Paul Ricoeur
probes the significance of our
capacity to recognize people
and objects, and of self-
recognition and self-identity in
relation to the gift of mutual
recognition. Drawing inspiration
from such literary texts as the
Odyssey and Oedipus at
Colonus, and engaging some of

the classic writings of the
Continental philosophical
tradition—by Kant, Hobbes,
Hegel, Augustine, Locke, and
Bergson—The Course of
Recognition ranges over vast
expanses of time and subject
matter and in the process
suggests a number of highly
insightful ways of thinking
through the major questions of
modern philosophy.
Action, Intersubjectivity and
Narrative Identity - Vinicio
Busacchi 2019-10-15
The book reconsiders Paul
Ricoeur’s speculative research
from the perspective of a
critical hermeneutics
understood as a general
methodology which is able to
work at an interdisciplinary
level. The specialisation of
sciences results in a
differentiation of knowledge
that determines advancement,
while also provoking a great
increase of complexity and
fragmentation. As such, among
the human sciences, some
problematic disciplines, like
psychoanalysis, sociology and
history, have not yet found a
unified methodological and
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epistemological structure. This
book argues that critical
hermeneutics may work as a
mediatory inter-discipline in
this regard.
Paul Ricoeur - Richard Kearney
2012-08-16
Paul Ricoeur′s work is of
seminal importance to the
development of hermeneutics,
phenomenology and ideology
critique in the human sciences.
This major volume assembles
leading scholars to address and
explain the significance of this
extraordinary body of work.
Opening with three key essays
from Ricoeur himself, the book
offers a fascinating tour of his
work ranging across topics such
as the hermeneutics of action,
narrative force, the other and
deconstruction while discussing
his work in the context of such
contemporary figures as
including Heidegger,
L[ac]evinas, Arendt and
Gadamer. Paul Ricoeur is also
published as Volume 21 Issue
5/6 of Philosophy and Social
Criticism.
Interpreting Nature - Brian
Treanor 2013-11-11
Modern environmentalism has

come to realize that many of its
key concerns—“wilderness”
and “nature” among them—are
contested territory, viewed
differently by different people.
Understanding nature requires
science and ecology, to be
sure, but it also requires a
sensitivity to history, culture,
and narrative. Thus,
understanding nature is a
fundamentally hermeneutic
task.
Ricoeur, Hermeneutics, and
Globalization - Bengt
Kristensson Uggla 2011-11-03
Ricoeur, Hermeneutics and
Globalization explores the
philosophical resources
provided by Paul Ricoeur's
hermeneutics in dealing with
the challenges of a world
framed by globalization. Bengt
Kristensson Uggla's reflections
start from an understanding of
globalization as an 'age of
hermeneutics', linking the
seldom related problematic of
globalization with hermeneutics
through Ricoeur's concept of
interpretation. The book
proceeds to embrace lifelong
learning as the emerging new
life script of the globalized



18

knowledge economy, the post-
national 'memory wars'
generated by the celebration of
national anniversaries, and the
need for orientation in a post-
modern world order. The author
argues that Ricoeur's

hermeneutics provide
intellectual resources of
extraordinary importance in
coping with some of the most
important challenges in the
contemporary world.


